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DEAL TOTALS DIP IN 2020, BUT AEROSPACE 
M&A IS READY TO TAKE OFF AGAIN 
The AlixPartners A&D Minute  

The pandemic’s enormous brunt on commercial aviation included putting a sudden end to the eight-year 
record run of mergers and acquisitions action in the overall industry. Aerospace and defense M&A activity 
had reached new heights in 2019, continuing a multiyear trend and fueled in total deal value by the massive 
merger between Raytheon and United Technologies.  

But the sudden halt in nearly all commercial air travel demand at the end of the first quarter of 2020 and 
the eventual instability in near-term forecasting led to a year of some notable deal cancelations, fewer 
transactions, and lower multiples. M&A activity had been increasing steadily for an aggregate 14% percent 
growth in deal count between 2012 and 2019. The drop in deal count in 2020 from 2019 alone came in at 
around 20% (Figure 1). The magnitude of the impact was especially prominent in the total enterprise 
value of deals, which dropped 77% between 2019 and 2020. This resulted in an average deal size decrease 
of 63% year-over-year. 

 

 

  

https://www.alixpartners.com/insights-impact/insights/record-merger-acquisition-activity-in-aerospace-defense-2019/
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The major disruptive factor was the massive decline in commercial air travel. By the second quarter, 
companies across the value chain had shifted focus to immediate cash management and rapid cost 
reduction. The sustained demand drop, combined with general uncertainty around the speed and 
magnitude of recovery, caused investors to hold capital instead of seeing this as an immediate buying 
opportunity. As a result, several transactions were paused or scrapped altogether as the dramatic change 
in market conditions made existing business plans obsolete and rendered prior valuation multiples 
irrelevant. These included, among others, the Woodward-Hexcel all-stock merger that was announced in 
January of last year and abandoned in April and Spirit AeroSystems’ planned acquisition of Asco that was 
terminated in September 2020.  

However, despite the substantive midyear dip, both deal volume and multiples saw sharp increases in the 
fourth quarter of 2020 (Figure 2). 

 

 

 

  

https://www.bloomberg.com/news/articles/2020-04-06/woodward-hexcel-end-aerospace-merger-pact-citing-pandemic
https://www.marketwatch.com/story/spirit-aerosystems-terminates-asco-acquisition-deal-more-than-2-years-after-it-was-announced-2020-09-25
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Targets with significant business exposure to government funding or other state support had the quickest 
and largest M&A activity upswing (Figure 3). Five of the top six announced deals in 2020, by valuation, 
came in defense or government demand-driven segments (Figure 4). Consistent with past years, private 
equity remains a considerable force and was involved in 60% of the top ten deals in 2020. 
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The increased defense activity has two core drivers. First, strategic and private equity acquirers are 
showing continued interest in emerging defense technologies. Examples include Raytheon Technologies’ 
acquisition of Blue Canyon, Lockheed Martin’s purchase of Aerojet Rocketdyne, and increased activity in 
core C4ISR, missile, and cyber technologies. Hypersonic systems have also shown potential for growth, 
including a $700 million U.S. Department of Defense investment in 2019. The second core driver is the 
divestiture of noncore businesses following recent large mergers. Newly formed Raytheon Technologies 
offloaded Forcepoint in October 2020 and L3Harris sold its military flight training business in March. While 
some carveout transactions are a regulatory requirement of the merger, others hold the potential for 
companies to strategically focus on more profitable core businesses. In Europe, defense companies are 
consolidating, partly to remain competitive with U.S. companies. The European Defense Fund, which 
finances new multistate collaborative projects, including last year’s partnership between Naval Group and 
Fincantieri, has proposed spending 8 billion euros on such deals in its latest budget.  

The SPAC liftoff 

SPACs, or special purpose acquisition companies, were a notable catalyst for the larger market in 2020. 
Since Virgin Galactic went public through this mechanism in 2019, there has been a dramatic resurgence 
of and explosive growth in the trend, with at least 11 more A&D-related SPACs going public per our 
analysis. Globally, of the $292 billion raised by all public offerings in 2020, $74 billion came from SPAC 
deals.  

SPACs are shells that trade on the public market with the primary goal of merging with a private company 
to take it public without the usual rigamarole of a traditional IPO. Because high-profile names, such as 
former Boeing CEO Dennis Muilenburg and L3 co-founder Bob LaPenta, can be associated with a SPAC, 
investors are happy to entrust money to the shell company. In A&D, the most attractive investments have 
been in emerging technologies, including Blade Urban Air Mobility going public at a $825 million valuation, 
Wheels Up agreeing to a $2 billion deal, and Lilium combining with Qell Acquisition Corp. to form a 
company worth $3.3 billion.  

As long as private investors keep pumping in money, SPACs are expected to be a significant factor in M&A 
going forward. That said, the mania has cooled lately, with IPO prices stagnating and some companies 
failing to find attractive deals. 

Outlook for 2021 

While we do not anticipate a similar volume of mega deals as in 2018 and 2019, the expectation remains 
that there will be progressive recovery in deal-making this year. Investor interest in commercial M&A has 
already started picking up, but there is still uncertainty around the topline profile of potential targets as 
many companies are still struggling with the impact of the pandemic and the lack of a clear recovery 
timeline. We do expect increased proactive consolidation in several commercial segments such as 
aerostructures, MRO, and aviation services, including mergers between equals and cashless mergers; of 
sustained transaction activity in defense, equipment, systems, and electronics (e.g., the recent acquisition 
of FLIR by Teledyne); and of additional carveouts from large groups, such as Rolls-Royce’s planned sale of 
its ITP Aero unit.  

Financial sponsors have dry powder and will remain active and seek to invest in platforms. Consolidation 
within the value chain, in particular aerostructures and part suppliers, will accommodate both the difficult 
situation commercial aerospace companies find themselves in and the need for OEMs to preserve and 
transform their supply chain for an eventual recovery and rebound in commercial traffic. 

   

https://spacenews.com/raytheon-completes-acquisition-of-blue-canyon-technologies/
https://news.lockheedmartin.com/2020-12-20-Lockheed-Martin-to-Acquire-Aerojet-Rocketdyne-Strengthening-Position-as-Leading-Provider-of-Technologies-to-Deter-Threats-and-Help-Secure-the-United-States-and-its-Allies
https://www.defensenews.com/land/2019/08/30/heres-who-will-build-and-integrate-the-first-hypersonic-weapon-system-prototype/
https://www.crn.com/news/security/raytheon-unloads-security-subsidiary-forcepoint-to-private-equity
https://www.aviationpros.com/education-training/simulator-training/press-release/21212386/cae-cae-to-acquire-l3harris-technologies-military-training-business-for-us105-billion
https://www.naval-group.com/en/naviris-jv-between-fincantieri-and-naval-group-now-fully-operational-694
https://www.naval-group.com/en/naviris-jv-between-fincantieri-and-naval-group-now-fully-operational-694
https://www.reuters.com/article/us-eu-budget-defence/eu-keeps-defence-fund-alive-with-8-billion-euro-proposal-idUSKBN23328S
https://www.theguardian.com/science/2019/oct/28/virgin-galactic-spce-launches-new-york-stock-exchange-richard-branson
https://www.nytimes.com/2020/12/19/business/dealbook/deals-mergers-acquisitions-2020.html
https://news.satnews.com/2021/02/10/direct-from-smallsat-symposium-sir-richard-branson-founder-virgin-galactic-dan-hart-president-ceo-virgin-orbit-keynote-address
https://www.wsj.com/articles/former-boeing-ceo-dennis-muilenburg-is-raising-200-million-for-spac-11612241902
https://www.nasdaq.com/articles/gabelli-led-defense-spac-lgl-systems-acquisition-files-for-a-%24125-million-ipo-2019-10-07
https://www.nytimes.com/2020/12/15/business/dealbook/blade-helicopter-spac.html
https://www.cnbc.com/2021/02/01/private-jet-company-wheels-up-to-go-public-in-a-2-billion-spac-deal-.html
https://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/lilium-announces-intention-to-list-on-nasdaq-through-a-merger-with-qell-acquisition-corp-and-reveals-development-of-its-7-seater-electric-vertical-take-off-and-landing-jet-301258288.html
https://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/lilium-announces-intention-to-list-on-nasdaq-through-a-merger-with-qell-acquisition-corp-and-reveals-development-of-its-7-seater-electric-vertical-take-off-and-landing-jet-301258288.html
https://www.theverge.com/2021/1/4/22213966/lidar-flir-teledyne-thermal-sensor-drones-nasa
https://www.reuters.com/article/us-rolls-royce-hldg-outlook-cfo/rolls-royce-to-start-sale-process-for-itp-aero-in-first-half-of-2021-idUSKBN28L0US
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